Damon Dickerson

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Damon Dickerson <dkdickers@gmail.com>
Tuesday, July 15, 2025 8:36 AM

Damon Dickerson

Fwd: City of Detroit — Misc. - KIOSK Payment Receipt

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: City of Detroit - Miscellaneous <paymentreceipts@divdat.com>
Date: Tue, Jul 15, 2025 at 8:34 AM
Subject: City of Detroit — Misc. - KIOSK Payment Receipt
To: <dkdickers@gmail.com>

CITY OF

DETROIT

City of Detroit

2 Woodward Ave.,

Detroit MI 48226

www.detroitmi.gov

Date::

Time::
Transaction ID::
Payment Method::
Auth Code::

Department:
Reference #:
Name of Payer:

Address of Payer:

7/15/2025
08:34 AM
21207591
MasterCard 8547
07809B

DPW Permits
MAP-25-59
Damon Dickerson

607 Shelby St.
Suite 731, Detroit
MI, 48226



Encroachment

Description: Application
Amount $400.00
Service Fee

Amount: ¥9.56
Total Amount $400.00
paid:

Thank you for your payment.

This communication, including any attachments, may contain information that is confidential and may
be privileged and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. Itis intended solely for the use of the
individual or entity to which it is addressed. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified
that any use, disclosure, dissemination, or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you
have received this communication in error, please notify the sender and return to us all delivered data.

Damon Dickerson, NCARB
Architectural Designer

Urban Adventurer

M.Arch University of Michigan



