Andy Brooks

From: Bill Vermeulen <bvermeulen@mbhtconstruction.net>
Sent: Thursday, September 26, 2024 5:20 AM

To: Andy Brooks; Kyle Osterhart; Paul Stoddard

Cc: Katie Thoits; Gay Maria Ray

Subject: FW: City of Detroit — Misc. - KIOSK Payment Receipt
Andy,

Payment receipt email is below, and a pdf copy is attached for you to include with the “review attachments”.

Bill Vermeulen
Senior Project Manager

€ 248.303.1016 | BVermeulen@mbhtconstruction.net
32500 Telegraph | Bingham Farms, Ml 48025

From: City of Detroit - Miscellaneous <paymentreceipts@divdat.com>
Sent: Wednesday, September 25, 2024 3:53 PM

To: Kristen Muller <kmuller@mhtconstruction.net>

Subject: City of Detroit — Misc. - KIOSK Payment Receipt

City of Detroit
2 Woodward Ave., Detroit MI 48226

www.detroitmi.gov

Date:: 9/25/2024
Time:: 03:52 PM
Transaction ID:: 17575443
Payment

Method:: eCheck 2225
Auth Code:: AUTH
Department: DPW Permits

Reference #: map-24-145
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Name of Payer: MHT Construction

LLC
32500 Telegraph
Address of Rd. Ste.100,
Payer: Bingham Farms, MI
48025

Enroachment Permit
for North Corktown

Amount $400.00

Description:

Total Amount

paid: $400.00

Thank you for your payment.

This communication, including any attachments, may contain information that is confidential and may
be privileged and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. Itis intended solely for the use of the
individual or entity to which it is addressed. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified
that any use, disclosure, dissemination, or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you
have received this communication in error, please notify the sender and return to us all delivered data.



