
MORE PARTICULARLY DESCRIBED
AS: BEGINNING AT THE SE CORNER
Of LOT 9 CRANE fARM SUB BLK 4
THENCE S 67D 13M 00 SEC W 88.50 fT
THENCE N22D 47M 00 SEC W 222.85
fT THENCE N67D 12M 58SEC E 88.S0
fT TO A POINT ON THE WLY LN Of A
16.9 fEET WD ALLEY THENCE S 22D
47M 00 SEC E 222.85fT TO THE POB
0.453 AC 19722.265 SQ fT

a/k/a 831 Selden
Tax Parcel ID 04000759.004

Block 4
PART Of LOTS 9 TO 16 CRANE

fARM SUB BLK 1 L60 P58 WCR, BEING
MORE PARTICULARLY DESCRIBED
AS: BEGINNING AT THE NE CORNER
Of 16 THENCE S 22D 47M 00 SEC E
ALG THE WLY LN Of A 16.9 fEET WD
ALLEY 330.90fT TH S 67D 13M 00 SEC
W 88.50 fT THENCE N 22D 47M 00 SEC
W 330.90 fT THENCE N 67D 13M
00SEC E 88.50 fT TO THE POB 0.672
AC 29284.663 SQ fT

a/k/a 830 Brainard
Tax Parcel ID 04000759.003.
Adopted as follows:
Yeas — Council Members Ayers,

Benson, Castaneda-Lopez, McCalister,
Jr., Tate, and President Pro Tem.
Sheffield — 6.

Nays — None.
––––––––

Housing and
Revitalization Department

June 30, 2021
Honorable City Council:
Re:  Request for Public Hearing to

Approve a Commercial Rehabilitation
Certificate on behalf of Oxford Peren-
nial Corktown PropCo, LLC, in the
area of 1541 Church, et al., Detroit,
Michigan, in accordance with Public
Act 210 of 2005 (Petition #473).

The Housing and Revitalization Depart-
ment, Planning & Development Depart-
ment and finance Department have
reviewed the application of Oxford Peren-
nial Corktown PropCo, LLC, and find that it
satisfies the criteria set forth by P.A. 210 of
2005 and would be consistent with devel-
opment and economic goals of the Master
Plan.

Public Act 210 of 2005 states that the
legislative body of the qualified local gov-
ernmental unit, shall by resolution either
approve or disapprove the application for
a Commercial Rehabilitation Exemption
Certificate in accordance with Section 3
and other provisions of this act. Prior to
acting upon a resolution to recommend
approval, a public hearing must be held,
and the City Clerk must provide written
notice of the public hearing to the asses-
sor and to the governing body of each
taxing unit that levies an ad valorem tax
within the eligible district.

We request that a Public Hearing be
scheduled on the issue of approving the

application for the Commercial Rehabilita-
tion Certificate. Attached for your consider-
ation, please find a resolution establishing
a date and time for the public hearing.

Respectfully submitted,
KELLY R. VICKERS

Chief Housing Development 
and Inspection Officer

By Council Member Tate:
Whereas, Pursuant to Public Act 210 of

2005 (“the Act”) this City Council may
adopt a resolution approving the applica-
tion of a Commercial Rehabilitation
Exemption Certificate within the bound-
aries of the City of Detroit; and

Whereas, Oxford Perennial Corktown
PropCo, LLC has made application for a
Commercial Rehabilitation Exemption
Certificate whose boundaries are particu-
larly described in the map and legal
description attached hereto; and

Whereas, Prior to such approval the
City Council shall provide an opportunity
for a public hearing at which a public
hearing on such adoption of a resolution
providing such tax exemption, at which
Public Hearing representatives of any tax-
ing authority levying ad valorem taxes
within the City, or any other resident or
taxpayer of the City of Detroit may appear
and be heard on the matter.

Now Therefore Be It Resolved, That on
the _________________, 2021 in the
City Council Committee Room, 13th floor,
Coleman A. Young Municipal Center, a
Public Hearing be held on the above
described application; And Be It  finally

Resolved, That the City Clerk shall give
notice of the Public Hearing to the general
public and shall give written notice of the
Public Hearing by certified mail to all tax-
ing authorities levying an ad valorem tax
within the City of Detroit.

Adopted as follows:
Yeas — Council Members Ayers,

Benson, Castaneda-Lopez, McCalister,
Jr., Tate, and President Pro Tem.
Sheffield — 6.

Nays — None.
*WAIVER Of RECONSIDERATION

(No. 36) per motions before adjournment.
––––––––

Department of Public Works 
City Engineering Division

June 25, 2021
Honorable City Council:
Re:  Petition No. 1461 — Crown Enter -

prises Inc., request to vacate and con-
vert to a utility easement that part of
Selkirk Street lying between the Cen-
tral Rail Road and foster Street. Also
to vacate the utility easement existing
within the vacated public alley lying
between Selkirk Street and Miller
Street, west of foster Street. Crown
Enterprises Inc., as part of the vaca-
tion of Selkirk Street, shall dedicate a
turnaround segment along Selkirk
Street, east of the Central Rail Road.
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Petition No. 1461 — Crown Enterprises
Inc., request to vacate and convert to a
utility easement that part of Selkirk Street,
50 ft. wide, lying between the Central Rail
Road and foster Street, 50 ft. wide, in
addition, to vacate the utility easement
existing within the vacated public alley, 14
ft. wide, lying between Selkirk Street and
Miller Street, west of foster Street. Crown
Enterprises Inc., as part of the vacation of
Selkirk Street, shall dedicate a turn-
around segment along Selkirk Street,
east of the Central Rail Road.

The petition was referred to the City
Engineering Division — DPW for investi-
gation (utility review) and report. This is
our report.

The request was approved by the Solid
Waste Division — DPW, and Traffic Engi -
neering Division — DPW, and City Engi -
neering — DPW.

Detroit Water and Sewerage Depart-
ment (DWSD) has no objection to the
vacation and conversion to utility ease-
ment provided certain provisions are met.
The DWSD provisions are a part of the
attached resolution.

All other involved City Departments,
and privately owned utility companies
have reported no objections to the vaca-
tion and conversion to utility easement of the
alley. Provisions protecting utility installa-
tions are part of the attached resolution.

I am recommending adoption of the
attached resolution.

Respectfully submitted,
RICHARD DOHERTY, P.E. 

City Engineer
City Engineering Division — DPW

By Council Member Benson:
Resolved, That part of Selkirk Street,

50 ft. wide, lying between the Central Rail
Road and foster Street, 50 ft. wide, being
land in the City of Detroit, Wayne County,
Michigan being:

Selkirk Street, 50 ft. wide, lying southerly
of and adjacent to lots 142 through 148
and northerly of and adjacent to lots 127
through 133, all within “Kosciuszko Subdi-
vision” as recorded in Liber 32, Page 91
of Plats. Wayne County Records.

Be and the same is hereby vacated as
public right-of-way and converted into a
private easement for public utilities of the
full width of the right-of-way, which ease-
ment shall be subject to the following
covenants and agreements, uses, reser-
vations and regulations, which shall be
observed by the owners of the lots abut-
ting on said right-of-way and by their
heirs, executors, administrators and
assigns, forever to wit:

first, Said owners hereby grant to and
for the use of the public an easement or
right-of-way over said vacated public alley
herein above described for the purposes
of maintaining, installing, repairing,
removing, or replacing public utilities such
as water mains, sewers, gas lines or

mains, telephone, electric light conduits
or poles or things usually placed or
installed in a public right-of-way in the City
of Detroit, with the right to ingress and
egress at any time and over said ease-
ment for the purpose above set forth.

Second, Said utility easement or right-
of-way in and over said vacated alley
herein above described shall be forever
accessible to the maintenance and
inspection forces of the utility companies,
or those specifically authorized by them,
for the purpose of inspecting, installing,
maintaining, repairing, removing, or
replacing any sewer, conduit, water
main, gas line or main, telephone or light
pole or any utility facility placed or
installed in the utility easement or right-
of-way. The utility companies shall have
the right to cross or use the driveways
and yards of the adjoining properties for
ingress and egress at any time to and
over said utility easement with any nec-
essary equipment to perform the above
mentioned task, with the understanding
that the utility companies, other than that
specifically prohibited by this resolution,
shall restore the easement surface to a
satisfactory condition,

Third, Said owners for their heirs and
assigns further agree that no buildings or
structures of any nature whatsoever
including, but not limited to, concrete
slabs or driveways, retaining or partition
walls (except necessary line fences or
gates), shall be built or placed upon said
easement, nor change of surface grade
made, without prior approval of the City
Engineering Division — DPW,

fourth, That if the owners of any lots
abutting on said vacated alleys shall
request the removal and/or relocation of
any existing poles or other utilities in said
easement; such owners shall pay all
costs incidental to such removal and/or
relocation, unless such charges are
waived by the utility owners,

fifth, That if any utility located in said
property shall break or be damaged as a
result of any action on the part of said
owners or assigns (by way of illustration
but not limitation) such as storage of
excessive weights of materials or con-
struction not in accordance with Section
3, mentioned above, then in such event
said owners or assigns shall be liable for
all costs incidental to the repair of such
broken or damaged utility; and

Provided, That property owners main-
tain for DTE Energy, full access to their
facilities at all times (i.e. gated access
with DTE locks at all ends of the ease-
ment) and that free and easy access to
the DTE facilities is reserved for DTE
equipment, including the use of back-
hoes, bulldozers, cranes or pipe trucks,
and other heavy construction equipment,
as necessary for the alteration or repair of
DTE facilities, And further
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Provided, That an easement, the full
width of the existing right-of-way, is
reserved for the Detroit Water and
Sewage Department for the purpose of
installing, maintaining, repairing, removing,
or replacing any sewers, water mains, fire
hydrants and appurtenances, with the
right of ingress and egress at any time to,
and over said easement for the purpose
above set forth; And Be It further

Provided, That free and easy access to
the sewers, water mains, fire hydrants
and appurtenances within the easement
is required for the Detroit Water and Sew-
erage Department equipment including
the use of backhoes, bulldozers, cranes
or pipe trucks, and other heavy construc-
tion equipment, as necessary for the
alteration or repair of the sewer or water
main facilities; And Be It further

Provided, That the Detroit Water and
Sewerage Department retains the right to
install suitable permanent main location
guide post over its water mains at rea-
sonable intervals and at points deflection;
And Be It further

Provided, That said owners of the
adjoining property, for themselves, their
heirs and assigns, agree that no building
or structure of any nature whatsoever,
including porches, patios, balconies, etc.,
shall be built upon said easement without
prior written approval and agreement with
the Detroit Water and Sewerage Depart-
ment: And Be It further

Provided, That if any time in the future,
the owners of any lots abutting on said
vacated alley shall request the removal
and/or relocation of the aforementioned
utilities in said easement, such owners
shall pay all costs incident to such
removal and/or relocation. It is further pro-
vided that if sewers, water mains, and/or
appurtenances in said easement shall
break or be damaged as a result of any
action on the part of the owner, or
assigns, then in such event, the owner or
assigns shall be liable for the costs inci-
dent to the repair of such broken or dam-
aged sewers and water mains, and shall
also be liable for all claims for damages
resulting from his action; And Be It
 further

Provided, That if it becomes necessary
to remove the paved alley returns at the
entrances such removal and construction
of the new curb and sidewalk shall he
done under city permit and inspection
according to City Engineering Division
DPW specification with all costs borne by
the abutting owner(s), their heirs or
assigns; And further

Resolved, The public alley, 14 ft. wide,
converted to utility easement by resolu-
tion per petition x2078 approved by the
City of Detroit City Council on June 9th,
1976; further described as land in the City
of Detroit, Wayne County, Michigan
being:

The east-west alley lying southerly of
and adjacent to lots 149 and 150, and
northerly of and adjacent to lots 147 and
148 of “Kosciuszko Subdivision” as
recorded in Liber 32, Page 91 of Plats,
Wayne County Records.

Be and the same is hereby vacated
(outright) as public right-of-way to
become part and parcel of the abutting
property, subject to the following
 provisions:

Provided, That cost and arrangements
for the removing and/or relocating of the
utility companies and city departments
services, And further

Provided, That any construction in the
public right-of-way such as curbs and
sidewalks shall be done under city permit
and inspection according to City Engi-
neering Division — DPW specifications
with all costs borne by the abutting
owner(s), their heirs or assigns; And Be It
Also

Resolved, That your Honorable Body
authorize the acceptance of the following
described property from Crown Enter-
prises, Inc. for public right-of-way
 purposes:

The southerly 20 ft. of the westerly 20
ft. of lot 142 and the northerly 20 ft. of the
westerly 20 ft. of lot 133, as well as that
part of Selkirk Street, vacated within this
resolution, between the westerly 20 ft. of
lots 133 and 142, all within “Kosciuszko
Subdivision” as recorded in Liber 32,
Page 91 of Plats, Wayne County
Records.

Provided, That Crown Enterprises Inc.
or their assigns shall design and construct
the new alley turnaround on Selkirk Street
as required by the City Engineering Divi-
sion — DPW (CED)/ Street Design Bureau
and the Traffic Engineering Division —
DPW; And further

Provided, That Crown Enterprises Inc.
or their assigns shall be responsible for
arranging the financing of the entire cost
of the proposed right-of-way construction,
including inspection, survey and engi-
neering; And further

Provided, That the entire work is to be
performed in accordance with plans and
specifications approved by CED and con-
structed under the inspection and
approval of CED; And further

Provided, That all taxes with respect to
properly of which the Dedication Area is a
part of shall be paid and proof thereof fur-
nished to the Law Department and/or City
Engineering Division — DPW: And
 further

Provided, That proof of compliance
with Detroit Ordinance No. 29-94, Detroit
Code Sections 2-1-11 through 2-1-15
also known as the Environmental Review
Guidelines, is furnished to the Law
Department and/or City Engineering Divi-
sion — DPW: And further

Provided, That the fee owner submit  a
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properly executed  deed  acceptable to
the Law Department and/or City Engi-
neering Division — DPW; And further

Provided, That the petitioner obtain
Traffic Engineering Division, signature of
approval on the final design and plans for

the construction of the alley turnaround;
And further

Provided, That the City Clerk shall within
30 days record a certified copy of this res-
olution with the Wayne County Register of
Deeds.
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Adopted as follows:
Yeas — Council Members Ayers,

Benson, Castaneda-Lopez, McCalister,
Jr., Tate, and President Pro Tem.
Sheffield — 6.

Nays — None.
––––––––

RESOLUTION TO PLACE 
REPARATIONS INITIATIVE ON THE

NOVEMBER 2021 BALLOT
By Council President Pro Tem. Sheffield:

WHEREAS, Detroit City Council
recently passed and adopted a unani-
mous Resolution Supporting Community
Reparations for Black Detroit; and

WHEREAS, An initial step in imple-
menting Council’s resolution would be
public affirmation of support for repara-
tions at a regular City election; and

WHEREAS, Section 3-105 of the City
Charter provides that Council may sub-
mit, by resolution adopted not less than
70 days before any election, any proposal
to voters of the City; and

WHEREAS, Implementation of repara-
tions for black Detroit will be materially
aided by establishing a voter-supported
reparations committee to make recom-
mendations for housing and economic
development programs that address his-
torical discrimination against the Black
community in Detroit; and

NOW THEREfORE BE IT RESOLVED,
that a voter initiative shall be placed on the
November 2021 ballot asking “Should the
City of Detroit establish a Reparations
Committee to make recommendations for
housing and economic development pro-
grams that address historical discrimination
against the Black community in Detroit?”

Adopted as follows:
Yeas — Council Members Ayers,

Benson, Castaneda-Lopez, McCalister,
Jr., Tate, and President Pro Tem.
Sheffield — 6.

Nays — None.
*WAIVER Of RECONSIDERATION

(No. 37) per motions before adjournment.
––––––––

WALK-ONS

Permit
Honorable City Council:

To your Committee of the Whole was
referred Petition of Michelle Yancy
(#1503), request to hold “Birthday Party”
at Cutters Bar & Grill — 2638 Orleans on
July 23, 2021 from 5:00 p.m. until 11:59
p.m. After consultation with the Mayor’s
Office and other involved City Depart-
ments, your Committee recommends that
same be granted in accordance with the
following resolution.

Respectfully submitted,
SCOTT BENSON

Chairperson
By Council Member Benson:

Resolved, That permission be granted
to Petition of Michelle Yancy (#1503),

request to hold “Birthday Party” at Cutters
Bar & Grill — 2638 Orleans on July 23,
2021 from 5:00 p.m. until 11:59 p.m., And
further

Provided, That such permission is
granted with the distinct understanding
that petitioner assumes full responsibility
for any and all claims, damages or
expenses that may arise by reason of the
granting of said petitioner, And further

Provided, That said activity is conducted
under the rules and regulations of the
concerned departments and the supervi-
sion of the Police Department, and in
compliance with applicable ordinances,
And further

Provided, That the Buildings and
Safety Engineering Department is hereby
authorized to waive the zoning restric-
tions on said property during the period of
the event, And further

Provided, That the required permits be
secured should any tents or temporary
installations such as Liquefied Petroleum
Gas Systems be used, And further

Provided, That the sale of food and soft
drinks is held under the direction and
inspection of the Health Department, And
further

Provided, That permission for the ser-
vice of alcoholic beverages is granted
contingent upon petitioner obtaining
approval of the Michigan Liquor Control
Commission and complying with applica-
ble City ordinances in connection with this
activity, And further

Provided, That the site be returned to
its original condition after said activity,
And further

Provided, That this resolution is revo-
cable at the will, whim or caprice of the
City Council.

Adopted as follows:
Yeas — Council Members Ayers,

Benson, Castaneda-Lopez, McCalister,
Jr., Spivey, Tate, and President Pro Tem.
Sheffield — 7.

Nays — None.
––––––––

UNFINISHED BUSINESS

Law Department
June 30, 2021

Honorable City Council:
Re:  Proposed ordinance to amend Chap-

ter 8 of the 2019 Detroit City Code,
Building Construction and Property
Maintenance, Article XV, Property
Maintenance. RE: Certificate of Col-
lection Box Maintenance.

Council Member Tate has requested
that the Law Department prepare an ordi-
nance to regulate donation bins in the City
of Detroit. The attached ordinance amends
Chapter 8 of the 2019 Detroit City Code,
Building Construction and Property Main-
tenance, Article XV, Property Mainte-
nance Code, Division 1, In General, by
amending Section 8-15-4, Definitions: C
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